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Abstract. The aim of the current research is to inspect the impact of tax awareness 

notion and taxation sanctions on the Motor Vehicles of tax compliance. Taxpayers 
compliance is a core aspect taking into account the fact that Indonesian taxation system 
keeps to the self-evaluation system. According to it the process of taxing gives trust to 
the taxpayers, so they are able both to calculate the tax pay and report obligations 
themselves. The model of the present article is a predictive one. It is based on mixed 
method approaches application through observation and interview activities with key 
respondents within the niche for processing and presentation of motorized vehicle data. 
This is the main source of research objects that gives information directly on the 
implementation of services at SAMSAT Karawang Regency's. A sample or respondents 
are motor vehicles personal taxpayers. In general, there were sixty respondents involved 
into the research. The SPSS 23.00 program with the approaches of multiply regression 
model operated methods of data analysis. The results of the conducted survey deduced 
that tax awareness and taxation sanctions significantly influence the Motor Vehicles of 
Tax Compliance. The results of partial test demonstrated that tax awareness and taxation 
sanctions have a positive impact on the Motor Vehicles of Tax Compliance. 

Key words: the tax compliance of Motor Vehicles, taxation sanctions, tax 

awareness. 
 
Introduction 
The terms of tax awareness and taxation sanctions belongs to more general concept 

of tax culture. The tax culture is usually understood as a part of the national culture of the 
state. It is associated with the activities of participants in tax legal relations and reflects 
the level of knowledge and compliance by citizens with legislation on taxes and fees, the 
accuracy of calculation, the completeness and timeliness of payment of taxes and fees, 
as well as awareness of their rights and obligations, which is formed from an 
understanding of the importance for the state (and specific region of the state if speak 
about the local budgets) and society of paying tax payments. It is common to associate 
directly the size of the shadow economy with the level of tax morality, which in turn 
depends on a number of factors, including features of the state political structure, level of 
socio-economic development of the country, moral and moral values of citizens and social 
norms of society in which they live, etc. The aim of modern governments is to force the 
development of taxation culture and tax morality in order to find optimal balance. 
Especially if speaking about Indonesian model of taxation that exists on self-evaluation 
basis.  

There are two types of tax applied in the Unitary State of the Republic of Indonesia, 
namely: (1) Central Tax and (2) Regional Tax. Based on Clause 1 number 10 of the 
Constitution of the Republic of Indonesia Number 28 of 2009 concerning Regional Taxes 
and Regional Levies. Regional Tax Definition means the taxpayers contribution to regions 
owed by individuals or entities that are formed based on the law, with no direct 
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compensation. It is used for regional needs for the greatest prosperity of the people 
(Undang-Undang Republik Indonesia, 2009). Every motor vehicles are increasingly 
owned by every level of society, the increase in motor vehicles causes the number of 
motor vehicle taxpayers to increase each year (Riuh Hutomo, 2017: 1-33; Nurkhin et al., 
2018: 240-255; Rizal, 2019: 76), this can be seen from the number of taxpayers registered 
at SAMSAT Karawang Regency's from 2013-2017 the number of taxpayers has always 
increased (Table 1, Fig. 1). 

 
Table 1. Number of Motor Vehicle Taxpayers Years 2013-2017 

Years 

 

Type of Tax Vehicles 

2-Wheeled 4-Wheeled Total 

2013 639,689 63,706 703,395 

2014 677,362 74,901 752,263 

2015 703,561 85,793 789,354 

2016 729,760 96,685 826,445 

2017 755,961 107,577 863,538 

Source: (Badan Pendapatan Daerah Provinsi Jawa Barat, 2018) 

 

 
Fig. 1. The Number of Motor Vehicle Taxpayers from 2013-2017 (Source: Badan 

Pendapatan Daerah Propinsi Jawa Barat, 2018) 
 

Based on Table 1 and Fig. 1 above, the increase of purchasing power of population 
for motor vehicles has a certainly positive impact on local governments. Due to the higher 
level of motorized vehicles ownership, it is expected that taxes payed for the local 
governments will also increase and have positive impact on flourishing of the region, 
especially in SAMSAT Karawang Regency's, West of Java. 

A number of previous studies has carried out the investigation of the interrelations 
of tax awareness and taxation sanctions with Motor Vehicles Tax Compliance in order to 
inspect the taxation awareness and the tax sanctions. The Fiscus attitudes to WP-OP 
compliance in South Minahasa District showed that tax awareness and tax sanctions 
have a major impact on taxpayer compliance (Tiraada, 2013: 999-1008; Saragih and 
Aswar, 2019: 269-278). The inspectation of motor vehicle taxpayers compliance in the 
paradigm of the policy of eliminating tax fines based-on Governor's Decree 
No.544/DISPENDA/2016 on the elimination of tax fines and transfer of motorized vehicle 
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names demonstrated that the factors of the elimination of tax fines and transfer of 
motorized vehicle names in the Regional Revenue Service of West Kalimantan Province 
deepen the moral obligations of taxpayers, and knowledge of tax factors (Riuh Hutomo, 
2017: 1-33). 

The influence of community consciousness, tax sanction and service quality toward 
tax mandatory compliance in paying motor vehicle taxes demonstrated that the 
understanding of taxpayer, tax awareness and tax sanctions have a significant effect. 
From another side the tax authorities’ services do not have any significant impact on the 
individual taxpayer compliance in SAMSAT Batam City (Tene et al., 2017: 443-453: 
Wirawati and Putra, 2019: 216-227). The Fiscus servicing and tax sanctions on the 
obedience of personal taxes obligatory supported the position of the existence of taxation 
awareness and tax penalties positive impact on the individual taxpayer. At the same time, 
socialization of taxation and fiscal service does not apply to individual taxpayer 
compliance for KPP Pratama Bengkulu City (Siahaan and Halimatusyadiah, 2018: 1-13). 
Therefore, the background of this study aims to the effect of tax awareness and taxation 
sanctions on Motor Vehicles Tax Compliance (Case Study on SAMSAT Karawang 
Regency's, West Java. 

 
Theoretical Framework and Research Models 
Consciousness is an element in humans to understand reality and how they act or 

behave towards reality. The public must continue to be invited to know, acknowledge, 
and respect and obey the taxation in force to create awareness and concern about 
taxpayer compliance will increase if awareness of taxpayers increases (Angraini and 
Khairani, 2019: 45-52). Awareness of paying taxes must be considered as a condition 
where someone knows and understands the process of paying taxes. Consciousness is 
an element in humans to understand reality and how they act or behave towards reality 
(Putri and Saleh, 2018: 416-430). 

Tax sanctions occur because there are violations of tax legislation, so that if a 
violation occurs the taxpayer is punished with an indication of taxation policies and tax 
laws (Tene et al., 2017: 443-453). Sanctions are needed so that regulations or laws are 
not violated. Tax sanctions are guarantees that the provisions of tax legislation will be 
complied with or obeyed. The application of administrative sanctions is generally imposed 
because taxpayers violate administrative matters as measured in tax laws (Ilyas and 
Burton, 2013: 65). 

Taxpayer compliance is the tax obligations fulfillment carried out by taxpayers in the 
parading of contributing to the development of the State, which is expected to be fulfilled 
on voluntary basis. Compliance of taxpayers is a core aspect taking into account that the 
taxation system in Indonesia adheres to the Self-Evaluation basis. According to this 
notion, the system gives trust to taxpayers to calculate pay and report obligations 
themselves (Siahaan and Halimatusyadiah, 2018: 1-13). 

The Big Indonesian Dictionary explains the term of obedience as a verb means to 
obey the teachings and rules. Compliance is the motivation of an individual, group, or 
organization to act according to the established rules. In tax, the applicable rule is the 
Taxation Law. Tax compliance is a person's compliance, in this case, a taxpayer, to tax 
regulations or laws (Tiraada, 2013: 999-1008). 

Taxpayers will obey in carrying out their tax obligations if the rates are correlated 
with local regulation norms and taxpayers have an awareness of paying taxes. Besides, 
there are also strict sanctions. Sanctions must be given to taxpayers who omit or 
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postpone violations of motor vehicle tax paying. The research model is formulated as 
follows (Fig. 2). 

 

Tax Awareness 

(X1)

Tax Compliance

(Y)

H1

H2
Taxation Sanctions 

(X2)

 

H3

 
Fig. 2. Research Model 

 
To answer the research question, this study uses a model regressions: 
Studies the impact of tax compliance of Motor Vehicles consists of tax awareness, 

and taxation sanctions (through H1, H2, and H3). 
 
Material and Methods 

This study of research is predictive research, objective to predicting certain 
phenomena based on general relationships that have been previously thought then to 
test hypotheses generally explains the characteristics of certain relationships or 
differences between groups or the independence of two or more factors in a situation (Ali 
and Limakrisna, 2013: 33,72). This study uses a mixed method approaches designed to 
be able testing on Motor Vehicles Tax Compliance to predict tax awareness and taxation 
sanctions factors through observation and interview activities with key informants in the 
section for Processing and Presentation of Motorized Vehicle Data which is the main 
source of research objects, then observes directly the implementation of services at 
SAMSAT Karawang Regency's. The population in this study also involves the 
respondents who motor vehicles personal taxpayers at the SAMSAT Karawang Regency 
located in the West Java area. In this study, the sampling technique was taken using an 
incidental sampling method, which is sixty respondents. The analytical method used is 
the multiple regression analysis. The data analysis technique is operated through the 
SPSS 23.00 program. The regression model formulated into the following equation: 

 

Y =  α + β1.X1 + β2.X2 + e 

A trial run in this study was carried out hypothesis testing through the simultaneous 
test (F-test), and partial test of the regression coefficient's (t-test). 

 
Results 

The results of this study were conducted by collecting data through observation and 
interview activities, which were then compared or strengthened with theories obtained 
from the results of literature studies.  
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The Partial Test of the Regression Coefficient's (t-test) 
T-Test results are presented in Table 2. 
 

Table 2. T-Test Results 

Variables The 
Regression 
Coefficient's 

Score 

T-Test 
Score 

Significant 
Probability 

Score 

Conclusions 

Constant 12,190  

Tax Awareness 0,116 0,721 0,000 Positive 
significant 

Taxation Sanctions 0,475 4,574 0,000 Positive 
significant 

 Source: Output form SPSS 23.00 (2018) 

 
Based on the resulting SPSS 23.00 Output (Table 2), the following regression 

equation can be made: 
 

Y =  12,190 + 0,116.X1 + 0,475.X2 + e 

The Simultaneous Test (F-test) 
F-Test Results are presented in Table 3. 

 

Table 3. F-Test Results (ANOVA) 

Model Summary Score 

F-statistics 17,795 

Significant Probability 0,000 

Source: Output form SPSS 23.00 (2018) 

 
Based on Table 3 above, shows the F-statistics score of 17,795 is greater (>) than 

F-table (df1; df2; 0,05 probability = 4,012973 score) so H0 is rejected (p < 0,05). This 
means that the variables of Tax Awareness and Taxation Sanctions have significant 
influence on the Motor Vehicles of Tax Compliance in SAMSAT Karawang Regency's, 
West Java. 

 
Discussions 
The first hypothesis testing results. Analyzing the results obtained after the first 

stage of the research allows to conclude that the tax awareness has a positive significant 
influence on the motor vehicles tax compliance. This is supported by a regression 
coefficient of 0,116 with a probability of 0,000. The result means that each increase of 
one level of the tax awareness of tax compliance of motor vehicles will increase the tax 
awareness amounted 11,6 percent or significant. The results of this stage support the 
overall research, which states that tax awareness has positive significantly influence 
toward the tax compliance (Tiraada, 2013: 999-1008; Tene et al., 2017: 443-453; Sukriah, 
Akram, and Inapty, 2009). The higher the level of taxpayer awareness, the higher the 
level of taxpayer compliance (Asrinanda, 2018: 539-550; Dzalika, 2018: 44-49; Hasan et 
al., 2017: 75-90). Taxpayers who have the awareness to pay motor vehicle tax will pay 
taxes on time. Because taxpayers are aware of paying taxes is a form of community 
service to the state and is a participation in supporting regional development (Susanto, 
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2018). Awareness of taxpayers includes awareness of tax rights and obligations to meet 
the obligation to pay taxes, public confidence in paying taxes for state financing, self-
impulse to pay taxes voluntarily. If taxpayers have carried out their tax obligations 
sincerely and are aware of the importance of taxes for the growth and development of 
their regions, there will be no non-compliance in paying taxes (Wardani and Rumiyatun, 
2017: 15-24). 

The second hypothesis testing results allows to make a conclusion that the taxation 
sanctions has a positive significant impact on the motor vehicles tax compliance. The 
thesis is supported by a regression coefficient of 0,475 with a probability of 0,000, and 
means that each increase of one level of the taxation sanctions of tax compliance of motor 
vehicles will cause increase of the tax awareness amounted 47,5 percent or very 
significant. The results of the current stage support the overall research which states that 
taxation sanctions has positive significantly influence toward the tax compliance (Tiraada, 
2013: 999-1008; Tene et al., 2017: 443-453; Riuh Hutomo, 2017: 1-33; Siahaan and 
Halimatusyadiah, 2018: 1-13). Tax penalties are factors that make taxpayers obedient in 
paying motor vehicle tax. Tax penalties will be given to taxpayers who commit violations 
or delays in paying taxes. Sanctions are needed to create discipline in paying taxes. The 
imposition of sanctions must be carried out strictly to all taxpayers who violate them. 
Taxpayers who violate or delay in paying taxes will be subject to administrative sanctions 
in the form of interest of 2% (two percent) each month from the Vehicles Tax owed for a 
maximum period of fifteen months. Taxation sanctions aim to prevent and educate 
taxpayers from violating tax norms. However, the sanctions provided are very light 
making many taxpayers do not comply with paying motor vehicle tax. Taxpayers who are 
obedient to paying taxes will surely see how much sanctions will be received if they are 
late or do not pay taxes. Conversely, taxpayers who do not comply and see the small 
sanctions obtained will make taxpayers do not comply in paying motor vehicle tax (Online 
Pajak, 2019). 

The third hypothesis testing results give possibility to make a conclusion that the tax 
awareness and taxation sanctions have a positive significant influence on the tax 
compliance of motor vehicles simultaneously. This is indicated by f-test results of 17,795 
score with a probability of 0,000, which contemporaneously states the existence of a 
mutual influence between the variable of tax awareness and taxation sanctions toward 
the tax compliance on motor vehicles in SAMSAT Karawang Regency's, West Java. 

 
Conclusion 
By the obtained results of the conducted research, it may be concluded the next 

thesis: it is proven that the tax awareness, taxation sanctions, tax awareness and taxation 
sanctions contemporaneously have a positive significant impact on the motor vehicles tax 
compliance within SAMSAT Karawang Regency's, West Java. The analysis of the results 
of the study allows us to conclude also that the tax culture within SAMSAT Karawang 
Regency's, West Java has optimal potential of development and plays an important role 
in the harmonious development of the local society and the whole state, as well as in 
minimizing the negative manifestations and scale of the shadow economy. 
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